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1819 May 21 

Representation of the Bank of England on the Expediency of 
resuming Cash Payments: ‘Representation, agreed upon the 20th 
of May 1819, by the Directors of the Bank of England and laid 
before the Chancellor of the Exchequer [on the Expediency of the 
Bank resuming Cash Payments]’.  With the resumption of cash 
payments by the Bank of England, Britain returned to a gold 
standard.  

 

——— 

AT A COURT OF DIRECTORS AT THE BANK, 

On Thursday 20th May 1819. 

THE DIRECTORS of the Bank of England, having taken into their most serious consideration 
the Reports of the Secret Committees of the two Houses of Parliament, appointed to 
inquire into the State of the Bank of England, with reference to the expediency of the 
Resumption of Cash Payments at the period now fixed,—have thought it their duty to lay 
before His Majesty’s Ministers, as early as possible, their sentiments, with regard to the 
measures suggested by these Committees for the approbation of Parliament. 

IN the first place it appears, that, in the view of the Committees, the measure of the 
recommencing Cash Payments on the 5th of July next, the time prescribed by the existing 
law, “is utterly impracticable, and would be entirely inefficient, if not ruinous.” 

Secondly, it appears, that the two Committees have come to their conclusion at a period, 
when the outstanding Notes of the Bank of England do not much exceed £.25,000,000; 
when the price of Gold is about £.4.1s. per ounce; and when there is great distress, from 
the stagnation of Commerce, and the fall of prices of imported Articles. 

IT must be obvious to His Majesty’s Ministers, that as long as such a state of things shall 
last, or one in any degree similar, without either considerable improvement on one side, 
or growing worse on the other, the Bank, acting as it does at present, and keeping its 
Issues nearly at the present level, could not venture to return to Cash Payments, with any 
probability of benefit to the Public, or safety to the Establishment. 

The two Committees of Parliament, apparently actuated by this consideration, have 
advised that the Bank shall not open payments in Coin for a period of four years, but shall 
be obliged, from the 1st of May 1821, to discharge their Notes in standard Gold Bullion, at 
mint price, when demanded in sums not amounting to less than thirty ounces.  And, as it 
appears to the Committees expedient, that this return to payments at mint price should 
be made gradually, they propose that on the first day of February next, the Bank should 
pay their Notes in Bullion, if demanded in sums not less than sixty ounces, at the rate of 
£.4.1s. an ounce, and from the 1st of October 1820 to the 1st of May following at 
£.3.19s.6d. an ounce. 

If the Directors of the Bank have a true comprehension of the views of the Committees in 
submitting this scheme to Parliament, they are obliged to infer, that the object of the 
Committees is to secure, at every hazard, and under every possible variation of 



Volume I 

The Rise of the Gold Standard, 1660-1819 

 131 

circumstances, the return of payments in Gold at mint price for Bank Notes, at the 
expiration of two years; and that this measure is so to be managed, that the mint price 
denominations shall ever afterwards be preserved, leaving the market or exchange price 
of Gold to be controlled by the Bank, solely by the amount of their issues of Notes. 

It further appears to the Directors, with regard to the final execution of this plan, and the 
payment of Bank Notes in Gold at mint price, that discretionary power is to be taken away 
from the Bank; and that it is merely to regulate its Issues, and make purchases of Gold, so 
as to be enabled to answer all possible demands whenever its Treasury shall be again open 
for the payment of its Notes. 

Under these impressions, the Directors of the Bank think it right to observe to His 
Majesty’s Ministers, that being engaged to pay on demand their Notes in statutable Coin, 
at the mint price of £.3.17s.10½d. an ounce, they ought to be the last persons who should 
object to any measure calculated to effect that end; but as it is incumbent on them to 
consider the effect of any measure to be adopted, as operating upon the general issue of 
their Notes, by which all the private Banks are regulated, and of which the whole 
Currency, exclusive of the Notes of private Bankers, is composed, they feel themselves 
obliged, by the new situation in which they have been placed by the Restriction Act of 
1797, to bear in mind, not less their duties to the Establishment over which they preside, 
than their duties to the Community at large, whose interest in a pecuniary and 
commercial relation, have in great degree been confided to their discretion. 

The Directors being thus obliged to extend their views, and embrace the interests of the 
whole Community, in their consideration of this measure, cannot but feel a repugnance, 
however involuntary, to pledge themselves in approbation of a system, which, in their 
opinion, in all its great tendencies and operations, concerns the Country in general more 
than the immediate interests of the Bank alone. 

It is not certainly a part of the regulatory duty of the Bank, under its original institution, 
to enter into general views of Policy, by which this great Empire is to be governed, in all 
its Commercial and Pecuniary transactions, which exclusively belong to the 
Administration, to Parliament, and to the Community at large; nor is it the province of the 
Bank to expound the Principles, by which these views ought to be regulated.  Its peculiar 
and appropriate duty is the management of the concerns of the Banking Establishment, as 
connected with the payment of the Interest of the National Debt, the lodgements 
consigned to its care, and the ordinary Advances it has been accustomed to make to 
Government. 

But when the Directors are now to be called upon, in the new situation in which they are 
placed by the Restriction Act, to procure a Fund for supporting the whole National 
Currency, either in Bullion or in Coin, and when it is proposed that they should effect this 
measure within a given period, by regulating the market price of Gold by a limitation of 
the amount of the Issue of Bank Notes, with whatever distress such limitation may be 
attended to individuals, or the community at large; they feel it their bounded and 
imperious duty to state their sentiments thus explicitly, in the first instance to His 
Majesty’s Ministers, on this subject, that a tacit consent and concurrence at this juncture 
may not, at some future period, be construed into a previous implied sanction on their 
part, of a System, which they cannot but consider fraught with very great uncertainty and 
risk. 

It is impossible for them to decide beforehand what shall be the course of events for the 
next two, much less for the next four years; they have no right to hazard a flattering 
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conjecture, for which they have not real grounds, in which they may be disappointed, and 
for which they may be considered responsible.  They cannot venture to advise an 
unrelenting continuance of pecuniary pressures upon the Commercial world, of which it is 
impossible for them either to foresee or estimate the consequences. 

The Directors have already submitted to the House of Lords, the expediency of the Bank 
paying its Notes in Bullion at the market price of the day, with a view of seeing how far 
favourable Commercial balances may operate in restoring the former order of things, of 
which they might take advantage: And with a similar view they have proposed, that 
Government should repay the Bank a considerable part of the sums that been advanced 
upon Exchequer Bills. 

These two measures would allow time for a correct judgement to be formed upon the 
state of the Bullion market, and upon the real result of those changes, which the late war 
may have produced, in all its consequences, of increased Public debt, increased Taxes, 
increased Prices, and altered relations, as to Interest, Capital, and Commercial dealings 
with the Continent; and how far these alterations thus produced are temporary or 
permanent; and to what extent, and in what degree, they operate. 

It was the design of the Directors, in pursuance of the before-mentioned two Measures, to 
take advantage of every circumstance which could enable the Bank to extend its 
purchases of Bullion, as far as the legitimate consideration of the ordinary wants of the 
Nation, for a sufficient Currency, could possibly warrant.  Beyond this point, they do not 
consider themselves justified in going, upon any opinion, conjecture, or speculation, 
merely their own; and when a system is recommended, which seems to take away from 
the Bank any thing like a discretionary consideration of the necessities and distresses of 
the Commercial world; if the Directors withhold their previous consent, it is not from a 
want of deference to His Majesty’s Government, or to the opinions of of the Committees 
of the two Houses of Parliament, but solely from a serious feeling, that they have no right 
whatever to invest themselves, of their own accord, with the responsibility of 
countenancing a Measure, in which the whole Community is so deeplu involved; and 
possibly to compromise the universal Interests of the Empire, in all the relations of 
Agriculture, Manufacture, Commerce, and Revenue, by a seeming acquiescence, or 
declared approbation, on the part of the Directors of the Bank of England. 

The consideration of these great Questions, and of the degree in which all these leading 
and commanding Interests may be affected by the measure proposed, rests with the 
Legislature; and it is for them, after solemn deliberation, and not for the Bank, to 
determine and decide upon the course to be adopted. 

Whatever reflections may have from time to time benn cast upon the Bank, whatever 
invidious representations of its conduct may have been made, the cautious conduct it 
adopted, in so measuring the amount of the Currency, as to make it adequate to the wants 
of both the Nation and the Government, at the same time keeping it within reasonable 
bounds, when compared with what existed before the war, as is shown in the Lords’ 
Reports, pages 10, 11, 12 and 13, the recent effort to return to a system of Cash 
Payments, which commenced with the fairest prospects (but which was afterwards 
frustrated by events that could not be foreseen nor controlled by the Bank;) are of 
themselves a sufficient refutation of all the obloquy, which has been so undeservedly 
heaped upon the Establishment. 

The Directors of the Bank of England, in submitting these Considerations to His Majesty’s 
Ministers, request that they may be allowed to assure them, that it is always their anxious 
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desire, as far as depends upon them, to aid, by every consistent means, the measures of 
the Legislature, for furthering the Prosperity of the Empire. 

ROBERT BEST, Sec.  

——— 

 

Source: Great Britain, Parliamentary Papers, House of Commons, 1819, 338, vol. 3, pp. 
359-362. 

 

 


